
BY-LAW NUMBER 111-2021 
OF 

THE CORPORATION OF THE CITY OF BRANTFORD 

Being a By-law to amend By-law 52-2021, being a By-law to Fix Fees and Charges to be 
collected by The Corporation of the City of Brantford for 2021. 

WHEREAS By-law 52-2021 as amended, is a By-law passed under the authority of Part 
XII of the Municipal Act, 2001 to fix fees and charges; 

AND WHEREAS City Council has determined that the fees and charges set forth in By­
law 52-2021 should be amended as set forth in this By-law; 

THE MUNICIPAL COUNCIL OF THE CORPORATION OF THE CITY 
OF BRANTFORD HEREBY ENACTS AS FOLLOWS: 

1. In this By-law, references to By-law 52-2021 shall mean By-law 52-2021 as 
amended from time to time. 

2. By-law 52-2021 is hereby amended Schedule (1) to the by-law in the 
following fashion: 
a. Reference Number 533 is amended by deleting "$53.01" and inserting 

"$50.44"; 
b. Reference Number 536 is amended by deleting "$23.01" and inserting "not 

applicable"; 
c. Reference Number 537 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 

inserting "$22.12"; 
d. Reference Number 538 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 

inserting "$16.81" 
e. Reference Number 540 is amended by deleting "$19.51" and inserting "not 

applicable"; 
f. Reference Number 541 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 

inserting "$17.70"; 
g. Reference Number 542 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 

inserting "$13.27"; 
h. Reference Number 543 is amended by deleting "$15.00" and inserting "not 

applicable"; 
i. Reference Number 544 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 

inserting "$15.04"; 
j. Reference Number 545 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 

inserting "$10.62"; 



k. Reference Number 546 is amended by deleting "$75.00" and inserting "not 
applicable"; 

1. Reference Number 547 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 
inserting "$75.00"; 

m. Reference Number 548 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 
inserting "$75.00"; 

n. Reference Number 549 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 
inserting "$44.25"; 

o. Reference Number 551 is amended by deleting "$30.00" and inserting "not 
applicable"; 

p. Reference Number 552 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 
inserting "$30. 00"; 

q. Reference Number 553 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 
inserting "$19.47"; 

r. Reference Number 555 is amended by deleting "$23.01" and inserting "not 
applicable"; 

s. Reference Number 556 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 
inserting "$22.12"; 

t. Reference Number 557 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 
inserting "$16.81"; 

u. Reference Number 559 is amended by deleting "$19.51" and inserting "not 
applicable"; 

v. Reference Number 560 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 
inserting "$17.70"; 

w. Reference Number 561 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 
inserting "$13.27"; 

x. Reference Number 562 is amended by deleting "$15.00" and inserting "not 
applicable"; 

y. Reference Number 563 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 
inserting "$15.00"; 

z. Reference Number 564 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 
inserting "$10.62"; 

aa. Reference Number 565 is amended by deleting "$361.06" and inserting 
"$353.98"; 

bb. Reference Number 566 is amended by deleting "$22.56" and inserting 
II $22.12"; 

cc. Reference Number 567 is amended by deleting "fee eliminated" and 
inserting "$19.03"; 

dd.Reference Number 568 is amended by deleting "$22.56" and inserting 
II $22.12"; 

ee. Reference Number 569 is amended by deleting "$22.56" and inserting 
II $22.12"; 



ff. Reference Number 571 is amended by deleting "$9.03" and inserting 
"$8.85"; 

gg. Reference Number 572 is amended by deleting "$9.03" and inserting 
"$8.85"; 

hh.Reference Number 573 is amended by deleting "$9.03" and inserting 
"$8.85"; 

ii. Reference Number 574 is amended by deleting "$4.52" and inserting 
"$4.42"; and 

JJ· Reference Number 575 is amended by deleting "$36.11" and inserting 
"$35.04". 

3. This By-law comes into effect immediately. 

READ A FIRST TIME 
READ A SECOND TIME 
PASSED 

April 27, 2021 
April 27, 2021 
April27, 2021 

MAYOR 


